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BONE Newsletter: 
past and upcoming events and activities 

Past Events 
 
ICTON 2008 
The National Institute of
Telecommunications, Warsaw, Poland,
together with Athens Information
Technology, and the IEEE/LEOS Poland
Chapter organised the 10th Anniversary 
International Conference on Transparent 
Optical Networks (ICTON 2008) which 
was hosted in Athens Information
Technology (AIT) premises. Some 
BONE WP- meetings were held together 
with the event and several BONE papers
were presented. 

 
BROADNETS 2008 
BROADNETS is an international 
conference focusing on broadband
communications, networks, and systems
and covers the entire gamut of next
generation networks, communications
systems, applications and services. 
 
ECOC 2008- BONE Exhibition Stand 

BONE held an exhibition stand at ECOC
2008 exhibition in Brussels on 22-24th 
September 2008. The stand displayed
information about BONE activities and
also posters and videos from other
associated European projects. The show 
was very successful and the stand
attracted many visitors. Projects 
represented on the stand (as well as 

BONE) were: PHOSPHORUS, HECTO, 
ISIS, TRIUMPH, NOBEL2, POF-PLUS, 
EUROFOS, FUTON etc  

 
First Plenary Meeting 
 
The first plenary meeting of BONE has 
been successfully held in Rome. It was 
attended by 90 participants 

Summer and Master 
Schools 
 
Faculté Polytechnique de Mons hosted 
the first joint Master school and Summer 
school of the BONE project. 
The Master school, consisting of two 
intensive days of tutorials (12 hours) 
devoted to optical fibre technology and 
propagation, took place on the 13th and 
the 14th of October 2008 
The Summer school, that took place 
between the 15th and the 17th of October 
2008, was dedicated to the theme “The 
role of electronics and signal processing 
in optics.” Lecturers coming from BONE 
presented in-depth tutorials on several 

NEWS ROUNDUP 
 
PAST EVENTS 2008  
Check out past public events 
where ICT BONE had an active 
participation  

FIRST PENARY MEETING 
The first BONE plenary meeting 
has been successfully held in 
Rome. 

SUMMER AND MASTER 
SCHOOLS 2008 
FPMs organized a Summer and a 
Master School in Belgium in 
October.  

UPCOMING EVENTS 
List of events to follow with high 
interest for BONE partners  

DELIVERABLES 2008 
November/December 2008 is the 
deadline for most of ICT BONE 
Deliverables 

OTHER MANAGEMENT 
NEWS 
Strict reporting deadlines in 
preparation of the BONE review 
meeting. 

 

BONE NEWSLETTER VOL. 1 OCTOBER 2008



BUILDING THE FUTURE OPTICAL NETWORK IN EUROPE www.ict-bone.eu 

aspects linked to this very hot topic.  

 
Deliverables 2008 
 
It is now high season for BONE 
deliverables. WP leaders are required to 
upload their deliverables (due at M0+11) 
by 25 December. 

 
Upcoming Events 

 
ICT 2008 
BONE will have an exhibition
(information) stand at the ICT 2008 event 
in Lyon on 25-27th November 2008 
(Europe's biggest research event for 
information and communication 
technologies). The stand will display 
information about BONE activities and 
also have brochure handouts from other 
associated ICT projects. Please join us in 
booth J09 if you are attending ICT 2008. 
All NoEs active at the time of the ICT 
2008 should select one PhD student from 
the Network to travel to Lyon for ICT 
2008. Andreas Drakos from UoPelop will 
be the EU Commission’s rapporteur for 
BONE. 
Furthermore John Mitchell – UCL WP 
leader invited to the Session: Next 
Generation Access Networks 
http://ec.europa.eu/information_society/e
vents/cf/item-display.cfm?id=487. 

 
ONDM 2009 
ONDM is a major European-based 
international conference focusing on the 
area of ultra high-speed transmission, 
switching and optical networking in 
general. The conference has gained a 
great reputation within the research and 
industrial community world-wide. Many 
consider the event instrumental to the 
steady EU-funded research and Industrial 
activities within the technical areas 
supported. The conference has been 
founded in 1997, under the visionary 

motto "Optical Internet" and is
technically sponsored by IFIP and IEEE. 
The 13th International Conference on
Optical Networking Design and
Modeling - ONDM 2009 - will be held in 
Braunschweig (Brunswick), Germany, on
Feb 18-20, 2009. 
As it is established practice at ONDM, 
the 13th instalment will focus on cutting-
edge, state-of-the-art research in optical 
networking and newly emerging areas.
ONDM will also encourage submissions
of research papers that relate to the topics 
of optical networking and to other areas 
and disciplines, such as integration of
optical and wireless networks or the role
of optical network for the future Internet
design. Controversial ideas and
approaches and their open discussion are
strongly encouraged. Moreover, ONDM
in Braunschweig will contribute to the 
community strengthening by inciting
interactivity among the senior and junior
participants as well as among the
industrial and academic participants, in
Europe and internationally. 
 
HSPR 2009 
HPSR 2009 brings together researchers
working on the forefront topics of 
switching and routing and the associated 
topics of architecture, performance
evaluation, algorithms, traffic control,
protection, multi-layer and multi-domain 
networking and security. We are
witnessing important design aspects such 
as power usage, design efficiency, secure
routing, and path optimization.
Presentations of the latest research results
provide a unique opportunity at this
workshop for discussions and exchange
of ideas to further the knowledge base in
this field.  
Call for Papers  
The aim of the 2009 International
conference on High Performance
Switching and Routing (HPSR 2009) is
to identify new trends in research and
technologies in the area of high-speed, 
high-capacity and high-quality switching 
and routing for both wired and wireless 
networks. HPSR 2009 will comprise
technical sessions for presentation of
novel research results, panel sessions for

discussion of hot topics, and tutorials 
presented by leading international 
experts.  
Important Dates  
Full paper submission: January 16, 2009 
Acceptance notifications: March 20, 2009 
Camera-ready due: April 1, 2009  
Tutorial submission: January 15, 2009  
 

Other Management News
 
The First Annual Review will be held in 
Brussels on 10 March 2009.  
The deadlines for providing input for the 
first annual reporting and review are the 
following: 
• by 25 December 2008: all deliverables 
• by 31 December : all on-line WP-

reports, Mobility, Publications,… 
• by 31 December : all PM numbers 
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